NGA Spring Meet Track Stake Results and Auction Price

NOV 1 Stake FINAL
Race 1

BALLYS GRANT

DECO EARLY RUM
SPEED TO BURN
BALLYS TED
ROOFTOP BELINDA
CJC'S CIMMARON

~ N> 01—

NOV 1 Stake FLITE 1
Race 2

SAN TAN DIEGO 5
ONECO TALLULAH 4
DV'S LEROY 1
KEEN TWIST 2
STRETCHIN IT OUT 8
NEVER RELINQUISH 7

NOV 1 Stake FLITE 2
Race 3

CJC'S KENO

CRAIGIE BRYDE
ROOFTOP D BARREL
BOHEMIAN JEAN

TNT JACKSON

BEN ABLE

~ N U1 00 D

NOV 2 Stake FINAL
Race 4

KEEN FLIGHT
ROOFTOP SAWEDOFF
BOHEMIAN DUET
ONECO MOMBASSA
CJC'S NINNESCAH
CJC'S BLACKJACK

I S LI CeREN I \V)

NOV 2 Stake FLITE 1
Race 5

KEEN KATY

TK QUICKENED

GRAVY TRAIN GAL
DECO BULL RUM

JUST CAUSE I CAN
WAX ON WAX OFF

QO U b DN

NOV 2 Stake FLITE 2
Race 6

CRAIGIE BERRY
BALLYS MARTY

ONECO WINNIE

BALLYS RUFUS
ROOFTOP FRENCY
CJC'S LOTTERY

N J 0o > 01

Bob Rider
George Adler

Micheal Frino
MRL Metals, LLC.
Scratched

Dianna Douglas
Claude Morin
George Adler
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

Scratched
Fred Currid
Lee Mundus

Anthony Napolitano, Jr.

Scratched
Scratched

Cary Alsobrook
Mike Yurik

Norman L. Rader
Passed ($6,250)
Scratched
Scratched

Dale Bean
Lamar Porter

Roger Spiess
Scratched

Mike Yurik
Lamar Porter
Scratched
Scratched
Passed, no bid
Scratched

$10,000.
$6,250.

$5,000.
$2,750.

$12,000.
$8,000.
$4,750.

$2,750.
$1,750.
$1,500.

$20,000.
$4,500.
$6,500.

$8,500.
$7,000.

$4,500.

$3,000.
$5,000.

00
00

00
00

00
00
00

00
00
00

00
00
00

00
00

00

00
00
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30.
30.
30.
30.
31.
31.

29.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.

30.
30.
30.
31.
31.
31.

29.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.

29.
30.
30.
30.
30.
.33

31

30
30

31

08
52
74
90
09
18

74
00
19
59
82
91

32
34
68
11
56
94

72
38
41
52
89
95

88
06
67
77
88

.20
.25
30.
30.
.20
31.

79
88

60



NOV 3 Stake FINAL
Race 7

BALLYS DAVIS

GRAN TORINO

TK BULLS EYE
BALLYS PARIS
BOHEMIAN JIM JAM
CJC'S HOLDEM

~ U= N

NOV 3 Stake FLITE 1
Race 8

SEEGOLD SEIKO

CJC'S CHIKASKIA
ROOFTOP RUGER
CRAIGIE HANNITY
KEEN DREAM

SANDY'S DREAM

QO B O IDN

NOV 3 Stake FLITE 2
Race 9

CRAIGIE BURNS
SEEGOLD CRYSTAL
ONECO ODESSA

PJ'S CHAMP

BALLYS ACE

ROOFTOP COLT

QO DO

DEC 1 Stake FINAL
Race 10

WP'S CAMEO

KB'S SABINA LASS
KT'S CANNONSHOT
KB'S EXTRA FAST
FAY'S LASS

FRISKY CAT

N = B 01 00 J

DEC 1 Stake FLITE 1
Race 11

CTW SHOTGUN WILL 1
CRAIGIE ALYSA 4
BOHEMIAN MITZI 7
FAY'S NEWMAN 5
KB'S MANCHACA 2
USS FINE TOUCH 8

DEC 1 Stake FLITE 2
Race 12

CDN BLACK I SUzZY
CDN BLACK JACK

T'S FREE N EASY
CANTHOLDBACK CAT
FAST AS LITE
CRAIGIE ABRBOT

N > 3 00 01—

Passed ($7,250)

Randy Doubles

Scratched
Scratched

Robert Litke
Scratched

Mike Yurik

Lee Mundus
James Blanchard
Scratched

George Adler
Jeff Kessler
Passed, no bid
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

Rodney Cooley
Rodney Cooley
Lamar Porter
Roger Spiess
Vincent Savill
Scratched

Everytime Enterprises
Randy Doubles

Norman L. Rader

Roger Spiess

Roger Spiess
Scratched

James Zawisa
Passed ($2,600)
Scratched
Passed ($1,250)

Passed, no bid

$3,000.

$5,500.

$1,250.
$1,250.
$2,600.

$4,000.
$2,500.

$21,000.
$10,000.
$5,750.
$6,750.
$2,100.

$11,000.
$3,500.
$3,250.
$1,500.
$1,700.

$8,000.

00

00

00
00
00

00
00

00
00
00
00
00

00
00
00
00
00

00

o U w N o U W DN o U b W DN o U b W N oY U W N

o U W N

30.42
30.45
30.48
30.66
30.80
30.82

30.15
30.37
30.62
30.69
30.93
30.94

30.27
30.50
31.27
31.39
OOoP
OooP

29.61
30.00
30.53
30.58
30.59
31.00

30.03
30.52
30.54
30.56
30.76
31.07

30.13
30.84
30.85
30.93
31.00
31.07



DEC 2 Stake FINAL
Race 13

CTW SHOCKPROOF 8
CDN IN THE BLACK 4
CDN BLACKBERRY 7
WW PLENTY RICH 5
LOCKDOWN LANDER 1
NIMBY REDHOTCODY 2

DEC 2 Stake FLITE 1
Race 14

KB'S EASY BOUNCE 4
WP'S CHAMPION 1
KB'S EQUINOX 2
KJM SHINING STAR 5
CHILTERN CHAMP 8
WW ESCAPE ARTIST 7

DEC 2 Stake FLITE 2
Race 15

CARTEBLANCHE CAT 1
NIMBY SAM I AM 4
KT BAILEY 5
THREE FRENCHHENS 2
BOHEMIAN SISSY 8
KATIE BUGS 7

DEC 3 Stake FINAL
Race 16

NIMBY SADIE GOGO 5
CTW HALO ZSA ZSA 8
WP'S CLINTON 4
MISTER RALPHIE 1
CTW SHEILA 2
NIMBY DOLLYROCKS 7

DEC 3 Stake FLITE 1
Race 17

GREEN EYED CAT

LIL JOE

CRAIGIE ADDIE

USS FLY OVER

CHUNKY CHUG

FAST BURN CAT

O JN O

DEC 3 Stake FLITE 2
Race 18

SUPER C CONDI 7
BOOSTER SHOT CAT 4
KJM SMILIN JACK 5
FAY'S BOONE 8
CDN BLU RAY 1
KB'S BIG SHOWOFF 2

Everytime Enterprises
Everytime Enterprises

Julia Ward
Scratched
Passed ($3,500)
Passed, no bid

Cary Alsobrook
Roger Spiess
Norman L. Rader
Steve Sarras

Scratched

Passed ($1,750)
Passed ($2,500)
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched
Passed, no bid

Dianna Douglas

Everytime Enterprises

Henry T. Howe
Passed ($1,250)
Passed ($2,250)
Julia Ward

Dolores Russell
Dianna Douglas
Passed, no bid
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

Passed ($1,500)
Steve Sarras
Vincent Savill
Passed ($1,500)
John Weber

$18,000.00

$9,500.00
$6,500.00

$9,000.00
$6,750.00
$6,000.00
$4,500.00

$9,500.00

$10,000.00

$7,250.00

$4,000.00

$7,500.00
$1,250.00

$5,000.00
$1,250.00

$1,200.00
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30.
.23
.35
30.
31.
31.

30
30

29.
30.
.56
30.
30.
30.

30

30.
.29
30.
30.
30.
30.

30

29.
30.
.29
30.
30.
.23

30

31

30.
30.
30.
30.
31.

30

31

04

46
05
46

75
31

61
66
77

17

47
64
80
83

77
13

87
88

31
71
73
76
31

.28
30.
30.
31.
.24
31.

56
72
13

31



DEC 4 Stake FINAL
Race 19

WW BOUNTIFUL
FAY'S REDFORD
KB'S MONSTA MAN
WW JOYFUL TIMES
NIMBY RAPID ROXY
KT'S CANNONBALL

N 3 & 00— O

DEC 4 Stake FLITE 1
Race 20

BOHEMIAN RHYTHM 7
WP'S COMMANDER 5
CDN BLACK MAGIC 1
INSTA GATOR 4
SUNSAND GURU 2
FAY'S MCQUEEN 8

DEC 4 Stake FLITE 2
Race 21

BOHEMIAN WOODY
CIRCUIT CITY CAT
CDN BLACK KNIGHT
SUPER C PALIN

CTW SHENANIGAN

KJM TOP GUN

N o O b J

JAN 1 Stake FINAL
Race 22

BLUE CHIP CAT 8
SAME AGAIN CAT 5
DECO EQUATION 7
CTW BELLAGIO 2
TK DREAM WEAVER 1
TK CHASIN DREAMS 4

JAN 1 Stake FLITE 1
Race 23

SIR TALKALOT

ANITA GIRL

HG TYSON

HG TAMARA

TK DREAMIN BIG

HG TITAN

N = B 01 J

JAN 1 Stake FLITE 2
Race 24

KB'S LINDY LADY 2
CTW LUXOR 1
LADY GINGERSNAP 7
DR'S BLACK SMOKE 8
MADAME OREO 4
PTL SOLO 5

Vincent Savill
Passed ($2,750)
Coleen Pace
Scratched
Passed ($2,500)
Cary Alsobrook

Norman L. Rader
Lamar Porter
Francesca Field
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

Norman L. Rader
Henry T. Howe
Steve Sarras

Passed, no bid
Steve Sarras

Claude Morin
Francesca Field
Passed ($1,750)
George Adler
Scratched
Scratched

Passed ($4,250)
Frank Pellittere
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

George Adler

Michael Carpenter

Scratched
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

$5,500.

$6,500.

$4,000.

$7,000.
$4,000.
$2,500.

$6,000.
$6,000.
$3,000.

$1,300.

$11,500.
$6,000.

$3,250.

$2,750.

$3,500.
$3,250.

00

00

00

00
00
00

00
00
00

00

00
00

00

00

00
00
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30.23
30.47
30.57
30.91
31.04
31.68

30.36
30.83
30.99
31.15
31.16
31.33

30.19
30.21
30.59
30.70
30.96
31.13

30.02
30.63
30.98
31.35
OOP
DNF

30.43
30.60
30.89
30.94
31.02

30.29
30.65
30.75
30.99
31.21
31.60



FEB 1 Stake FINAL

Race 25

GO BON HAWK TALK
DUKE OF DAVRON
CRAIGIE POTUS

GO BON JITTERBUG
MAJESTIC SIN

GO BON DISHLADY

FEB 1 Stake FLITE 1

Race 26

KELSOS LORENZO
GO BON BAD DADDY
ROLLIN PHAT
KELSOS JAM JAR
RED HOT BARON
CRAIGIE IMA CHIC

FEB 1 Stake FLITE 2

Race 27

GO BON CHEAPTRIX
FAWNZIE SCHEME
BOOM GET SWOLE
GO BON GOOD TIME
CRAIGIE DENELLI
JOKER MONDAY

AUG/SEP 1 Stake FINAL

Race 28

BI'S SMOOTH MOVE
JAMMIN ANNA

TIPP MICHELIN
TIPP BANDANA
BACKSTRETCH
CJC's JEDI

O J N o

I G e o)

4
8
1
2
7
5

1
2
8
5
4
7

Bob Rider
George Adler
George Adler
Passed ($7,500)
Passed ($5,000)

H. Hal Gill or Vince Ber

Terry Scott
Passed ($1,250)

Scratched
Vince Berland

Bob Rider
Passed ($2,500)
Scratched
Scratched
Passed, no bid

Rodney Cooley

Scratched
Scratched
Passed ($1,500)
Scratched

AUG/SEP 1 Stake FLITE 1

Race 29

CTW INVADER

DECO JOGAWAY
KB'S STEPPIN OUT
CAREER GOALS

CTW UNLEASHED
NEXT TUESDAY

GNP B> J 0

Coleen Pace
Green Smith
Lamar Porter
Scratched
Scratched
Passed ($2,000)

AUG/SEP 1 Stake FLITE 2

Race 30

BI'S DEVIL MAMA
LATIN FURY

KB'S SLAMIN YAMI
SWEET MARY

TAPCO TUSCALOOSA
SCREEN QUEEN

U1 3 00 N

Rodney Cooley
Passed ($1,500)
Lee Mundus
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

$11,000.
$6,500.
$5,000.

$7,000.

$4,500.

$2,500.

$5,000.

$14,000.

$11,000.
$5,500.
$4,500.

$7,000.

$2,000.

00
00
00

00

00

00

00

00

00
00
00

00

00

o U b W N oY U W N

g w N

g W N
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30.07
30.31
30.51
30.77
30.86
30.99

30.20
30.32
30.71
30.97
32.31
OoP

30.27
30.31
30.65
30.71
30.92

29.85
29.93
30.42
30.47
30.51

29.99
30.04
30.47
30.48
30.57

30.13
30.51
30.71
30.72
31.18



AUG/SEP 2 Stake FINAL
Race 31

BI'S FAST PACE
HEZA CAREER MAN
KB'S DUNCAN

CTW UNVEILED
KB'S LOUD SPIRIT
TIPP BANDIT

Rodney Cooley

S. Lester Raines
Randy Doubles
Thomas Lindh
Roger Spiess
Scratched

N > = 00 01 J

AUG/SEP 2 Stake FLITE 1
Race 32

KB'S BAMA SLAMA 8 Lamar Porter

CTW INTIMIDATOR 1 Christopher J. Darcy
TIPP BIKER 7 Scratched

TURBO TIME 2 Passed ($1,250)
BANGO 4 Norman L. Rader
JAMMIN BRAVO 5

AUG/SEP 2 Stake FLITE 2

Race 33

SWITZLER HARP 4 Dale Bean
BAD HANGOVER 5 Passed, no bid
KAYJAY STILLS 2 Scratched

GO BON TRASHYANN 1 Scratched
HYBRID TRENT 8 Scratched
TAPCO TALLADEGA 7 Scratched

AUG/SEP 3 Stake FINAL
Race 34

CTW GIDDY GAL 2 Coleen Pace

BI'S OWENS GIRL 4 Norman L. Rader
SUGAR COAT LOVER 8 Michael Frino
TIPP STAR 7 Scratched
SWITZLER DRUMS 5 S. Lester Raines
CJC'S BLAZE 1 Scratched

AUG/SEP 3 Stake FLITE 1

Race 35

KB'S CUZAK 8 Lamar Porter
TIPP DEJA VU 2 Scratched
SWITZLER PICCOLO 5 Francesa Field
SUNSAND FANNYMAY 1 Passed ($1,500)
PFANNYS BRINSOP 7 Scratched
PICKY RICKY LEE 4 Scratched

AUG/SEP 3 Stake FLITE 2
Race 36
KB'S ABEL TO FLY 4 Kevin Fulton
BI'S GAME OVER 7 Lamar Porter
KAYJAY YOUNG 1 Scratched
CTW INTREPID 5 Robert Peterson or Shamr
ZE'S BENLEY 2 Scratched
8

SE'S WHOOPI Scratched

$13,000.
$7,000.
$4,500.
$6,500.
$3,750.

$7,000.
$4,750.

$2,500.

$3,750.

$10,500.
$10,000.
$3,000.

$3,750.

$6,000.

$2,500.

$6,500.
$8,500.

$5,000.

00
00
00
00
00

00
00

00

00

00
00
00

00

00

00

00
00

00
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29.
30.
30.
30.
30.
31.

30

30.
30.
31.
.29
.32
31.

31
31

30.
.33
30.
.56
30.

30

30

30.
.24
.36
30.
30.
.22

30
30

31

30

31

96
14
49
55
84
00

.22
30.
30.
31.
31.
31.

75
81
08
13
33

58
91
17

43

01

46

88

00

60
94

.20
30.
30.
.28
31.
31.

79
85

54
82



AUG/SEP 4 Stake FINAL

Race 37

CTW UNDENIABLE
BI'S NO WALKIN
SWITZLER BANJO
DECO FASTAWAY
JAMMIN FIRE

RC BABY GIRL

ON R Jb> O,

Everytime Enterprises
Dale Bean

Daniel Ryan

Scratched

Passed, no bid

AUG/SEP 4 Stake FLITE 1

Race 38
SALTY IGUANA
HOPPER OVER
FLASHPOINT
SE'S WONDER
KB'S MARINERO
KB'S JADALIN

SN 3 0 O

Green Smith
Passed ($3,000)

Scratched
Francesca Field
Karen Heise

AUG/SEP 4 Stake FLITE 2

Race 39

YO EAT MY DUST 2
TIPP LONDON 7
KB'S BALLY WHO 1
SE'S LADY JO 8
BACKCOURT BROOKE 4
CJC'S CHARMY 5

OCT 1 Stake FINAL
Race 40

CRAIGIE DOVE

WP'S RAINBOW
CRAIGIE MURPHY
CTW ROCK CANDY
CTW SWING SET
CRAIGIE COOK

GNP 0 J b

OCT 1 Stake FLITE 1
Race 41

UB TRIXIE

HK'S SAMBA

BOHEMIAN EDMOND
BUMPLEO

GRAND BAHAMA RUM
SUPER C GEIGER

DS o 9N O

OCT 1 Stake FLITE 2
Race 42

CTW ROCK STEADY
ONECO MARTIN
BOHEMIAN FABLE

HI REV HARLEY

TK ON THE DOUBLE
CRAIGIE DOBSON

Francesca Field
Scratched
Norman L.
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

Rader

Steve Sarras

Henry T. Howe
Green Smith
Francesca Field
Anthony Napolitano,
Norman L. Rader

Jr.

Robert Litke
Joseph Frenette
Tomas Lindh
Scratched
Scratched

Steve Sarras
N.J. Sherck
Steve Gilster
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

$10,000.
$8,000.
$8,250.

$4,000.

$2,000.
$2,500.

$4,000.

$2,250.

$15,000.
$13,000.
$10,500.
$4,250.
$3,000.
$3,750.

$14,000.
$3,000.
$5,500.

$8,000.
$2,250.
$2,250.

00
00
00

00

00
00

00

00

00
00
00
00
00
00

00
00
00

00
00
00
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30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
31.

30.
30.
.59
30.
31.
31.

30

30.
30.
30.
30.

29.
30.
.28
30.
30.

30

30.
.39
30.
30.
31.
.58

30

31

30.
30.
30.
31.
31.
31.

36
41
52
60
76
33

41
45

84
11
80

47
64
74
75

78
00

48
73

11

71
98
07

11
51
57
06
35
47



OCT 2 Stake FINAL
Race 43

CRAIGIE RUSTIC 1
NITRO MIDGET 2
CTW ROCKSLIDE 4
WP'S REDWING 5
CRAIGIE MACDAID 7
WP'S ROYAL 8

OCT 2 Stake FLITE 1
Race 44

KB'S LEXUS

CRAIGIE CARLYLE
BOHEMIAN SIMILE
NITRO LIVE WIRE
CAPTAIN BLUE

HI NOON SHOWOFF

R B 3 00 01N

OCT 2 Stake FLITE 2
Race 45

BOHEMIAN BLANCHE 7
WW'S STAR DANTE 5
ROOFTOP SLIM TO 2
CTwW TIVO 1
TRENT VICTORY 4
PTL PETE 8

OCT 3 Stake FINAL
Race 46

CTW TIN MAN

CTW ROCKY ROAD

TK BIG WHEELS
CRAIGIE DOCHART
NITRO LUCKYCHARM
JUNGLE JAZZ

U= 00N B J

OCT 3 Stake FLITE 1
Race 47

KB'S COROLLA

HK'S BUGABOO

CTW TINKERTOY

ZE'S HAYLEY

CTW TICKER TAPE
SUPREME COURT

O N O

OCT 3 Stake FLITE 2
Race 48

HI NOON SHOWDOWN 5
WW CRUZIN ELAINE 2
WP'S BOSTON 1
CRAIGIE LAWSON 8
WW'S STAR DANIEL 4
WW MARION 7

Green Smith
Rick Bartley
Coleen Pace

S. Lester Raines
Randy Doubles
Kenneth Larison

Mike Yurik
Norman L. Rader
Norman L. Rader
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

Greg Deuel
Passed ($3,000)
C. Don Godby
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

Everytime Enterprises

Chris Politis
Pat Dalton
Cary Alsobrook
Scratched
Scratched

Alan Piper
Alan Piper
Green Smith
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

Norman L. Rader
Passed ($1,500)
Byron Jay Childs
James Blanchard
Scratched
Scratched

$6,000.
$9,750.
$7,500.
$6,750.
$3,250.
$2,250.

$8,750.
$5,250.
$5,500.

$3,000.

$4,250.

$20,000.
$9,750.
$10,500.
$8,500.

$7,500.
$5,500.
$5,500.

$7,500.

$2,750.
$1,500.

00
00
00
00
00
00

00
00
00

00

00

00
00
00
00

00
00
00

00

00
00
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30.
30.
30.
31.
31.
31.

30

30.
30.
30.
31.
.28
31.

31

29.
30.
30.
.54
30.
31.

30

30

30.
30.
30.
30.
31.
31.

61
71
79
03
05
16

.24
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.

34
35
57
82
91

66
68
76
17

59

93
07
08

71
02

.51
30.
30.
30.

57
84
99

44
65
79
84
36
46



OCT 4 Stake FINAL

Race 49

CTW ROCKPORT
HK'S SPARKY
GALE WW WILBUR
NITRO HAWKEYE
CRAIGIE MACVEY
CRAIGIE CORA

OCT 4 Stake FLITE 1

Race 50

WP'S QUEEN

ONECO CAHILL
BARBADOS RUM

CTW TICTAC DOUGH
WW'S STAR DIEGO
PTL ROWDY

OCT 4 Stake FLITE 2

Race 51

CTW TIGHT WAD
WP'S MADONNA

UB QUEEN CARRIE
CRAIGIE DAWSON
BOHEMIAN PARABLE
PJ'S JAY

N > 3 O = 0 =N S J 01 o

~ O = 0N

DEC 4 Stake BORCHERS

Race 52
SPOTLITE JAKE
ONECO LANCER
LOCKDOWN LEWIS
SUNSAND BLACKTOP
MEGA MCBRIDE
CJC'S JACKPOT

O

1
8
7
2
4
5

Passed ($12,000)
Lamar Porter
Rodney Cooley
Scratched

Steve Gilster
Passed, no bid

River Street Investments

Coleen Pace
Scratched
Arthur Agganis
Scratched

Joe Trudden

John Melillo
Francesca Field
Scratched

James Blanchard
Scratched
Scratched

H. Hal Gill
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched
Scratched

$6,500.
$25,000.

$2,250.

$7,250.
$4,250.

$3,000.

$2,000.

$3,250.
$3,750.

$1,250.

$1,750.

00
00

00

00
00

00

00

00
00

00

00

g w N o U b W N oY U W N

DS N

29.
29.
30.
.37
30.
30.

30

30.
30.
30.
30.
31.
31.

30.
30.
31.
31.
.21

31

30.
31.
31.
31.

70
93
17

39
67

41
78
81
84
19
89

64
92
04
12

59
16
40
65



